GOVERNMENT OF PUDUCHERRY

ABSTRACT
LABOUR — The Factories Act, 1948 read with the Puducherry Factories Rules, 1964 —

LABOUR DEPARTMENT
A e
G.0.Ms. No. 1/AIL/LAB/G/2024 Puducherry, dated [ Y4 JAN 2024
READ : This Department I.D. No. 369/AIL/LAB/G/2013 dated 19.7.2023

ORDER : The following Notification shall be published in the next issue of
Official Gazette :-

NOTIFICATION

Whereas, the draft rules seeking to amend the Puducherry Factories Rules,
1964, was issued in the Government of Puducherry, Labour Department’s Notification
under G.0.Ms.No.06/AIL/Lab/G/2022, dated 31* May 2022 and published as required
under sub-section (1) of section 115 of the Factories Act, 1948 (Central Act 63 of
1948), in the Extraordinary Gazette Part —II, No.31, dated 12" July 2022 of the
Government of Puducherry inviting objections and suggestions, if any, from all persons

likely to be affected thereby;

AND WHEREAS, no objection or suggestion has so far been recelvcd from

any quarter in this regard,;

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred under sectlon 112
of the Factories Act, 1948, the Lieutenant- Governor, Puducherry, hereby makes the
following rules further to amend the Puducherry Factories Rules, 1964, namely ~

L. Short title and commencement : (1) These rules may be called the
Puducherry Factories (Amendment) Rules, 2023.

)20 (2). They shall come into force on and from the date of their
)

#an
3 20

publication nthe Official Gazette.



2. Amendment to rule 4 - In the Puducherry Factories Rules, 1964 (hereinafter referred to as the said _,r.w..mmmr in rule 4,for the existing
schedule there under, the following Schedule shall be substituted, namely:..

"SCHEDULE”

x>

Total Horse Power

Maximum number of persons to be employed on any day during the year

Installed inclusive of

Mobile Equipments 9 20 50 100 250 500 1000 2000 5000 10000 Above 10000
(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6) (7) (8) (9) (10) (11) (12)

Fees Payable in Rupees

Nil Horse Power Rs.800 Rs.1,600 Rs.2,400 Rs.3,200 Rs.7,200 Rs.10,800 Rs.24,000 Rs.36,000 Rs.66,000 Rs.96,000 Rs.1,20,000

nwwwww il Rs.1,600 | Rs.2,400 Rs.3,200 Rs.4,800 Rs.10,800 | Rs.18,000 | Rs.48,000 | Rs.72,000 | Rs.1,08000 | Rs.1,44,000 | Rs.1,80,000

Above 10 Horse

Power upto 50 Rs.2,400 Rs.3,200 Rs.4,800 Rs.7,200 Rs.18,000 Rs.28,800 Rs.72,000 Rs.1,08,000 Rs.1,44,000 Rs.1,80,000 Rs.2,16,000

Horse Power

Above 50 Horse

Power upto 129 Rs.3,200 Rs.4,800 Rs.7,200 Rs.12,000 Rs.28,800 Rs.48,000 Rs.1,08,000 | Rs.1,44,000 Rs.1,80,000 Rs.2,16,000 Rs.2,40,000

Horse Power

Above 129 Horse

Power upto 250 Rs.4,800 Rs.7,200 Rs.12,000 Rs.19,200 Rs.48,000 Rs.72,000 Rs.1,44,000 | Rs.1,80,000 | Rs.2,16,000 Rs.240,000 Rs.2,64,000

Horse Power

Above 250 Horse

Power upto 500 Rs.7,200 Rs.12,000 Rs.16,000 Rs.25,600 Rs.72,000 Rs.96,000 Rs.1,80,000 Rs.2,16,000 Rs.2,40,000 Rs.2,64,000 Rs.288,000

Horse Power

Above 500 Horse

Power upto 1000 Rs.12,000 Rs.12800 Rs..25,600 Rs.48,000 Rs.96,000 Rs1,20,000 Rs2,16,000 Rs.2,40,000 Rs.2,64,000 Rs.2,88,000 Rs.3,12,000

Horse Power

Above 1000 Horse

Power upto 2000 Rs.12,800 Rs.25,600 Rs.48,000 Rs.64,000 Rs.1,20,000 Rs1,44,000 Rs.2,40,000 Rs.2,64,000 Rs.2,88,000 Rs.3,12,000 Rs.3.36,000

Horse Power

Above 2000 Horse

Power upto 5000 Rs.25,600 Rs.48,000 Rs.64,000 Rs.80,000 Rs.1,44,000 Rs.1,68,000 Rs2,64,000 Rs.2,88,000 Rs.3,12,000 Rs.3,36,000 Rs.3,60,000

Ho.rse Power

Above 5000 Horse

Power upto 7500 Rs.48,000 Rs.64,000 Rs.80,000 Rs.96,000 Rs.1,68,000 Rs.1.92,000 Rs.2,88,000 Rs.3,12,000 Rs.3,36,000 Rs.3,60,000 Rs.3,84,000

Horse power

Above 7500 Horse

Power upto 10000 Rs.64,000 Rs.80,000 Rs.96,000 Rs.1,12,000 Rs.1,92,000 Rs.2,16,000 Rs.3,12,000 Rs.3,36,000 Rs.3,60,000 Rs.3,84,000 Rs.4,08,000

Horse Power

wwwﬂw 10000 Horse | p: 80,000 | Rs.96,000 | Rs.1,12,000 | Rs.1,28,000 | Rs.2,16,000 | Rs.2,40,000 | Rs.3,36,000 | Rs.3,60,000 | Rs.3,84,000 | Rs4,08000 | Rs.4,32,000




55

3. Amendment to rule 5 - In the said rules, in sub-rule (3), for the words

“fifty rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees”, shall be substituted.

4. Amendment to rule 7 - In the said rules, in sub-rule (2), for the words

“one hundred rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees”, shall be substituted.

5. Amendment to rule 9 - In the said rules, for the words “one hundred

rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees”, shall be substituted.

6. Amendment to rule 105 - In the said rules, in clause (a) of sub - rule
(2-A), for the figures and words “rupees 50per year per worker”, the figures

and words, “rupees 200 per yearper worker” shall be substituted.

(BY ORDER OF THE LIEUTENANT GOVERNOR)

\g/

(P. RAGI
UNDER SECRETARY TO GOVERNMENT
(LABOUR)

To

The Director of Stationery & Printing With a request to supply 50 copies of
Puducherry. the Notification to this Department.

Copy to:

The Chief Inspector of Factories, Puducherry
The Deputy Labour Commissioner, Puducherry.
The Joint Chief Inspector of Factories, Puducherry
The Inspector of Factories, Puducherry/ Karaikal.
The Labour Officer (Enforcement), Puducherry
The Labour Officer, Karaikal.
. The Assistant Inspectors of Labour, Puducherry/Karaikal/Mahe/Yanam.
\/8/ The Web Master, Labour Department, Puducherry
9. G.O. Copy / Spare.

N YA



